
Re: gday
From: Daryl Maguire 
To: Phil Elliott <phil.elliott@riverinastrata.com.au>
Date: Wed, 25 Jun 2014 11:34:22 +1000

Great,  I paid Rebecca $500 and Nic $300. Before you distribute can I see the amounts. We need to
add Maggie into these and Rebecca was a one off. I think the partnership is You  Me Nic Julian Maggie
DuWei .  

Sent from my iPad

On 25/06/2014, at 10:38 AM, "Phil Elliott" < phil.elliott@riverinastrata.com.au> wrote: 

Did a distribution and have funds for Bec and Nicole to hand , balance held by me for you and I
incl compensation for expenses to you.

Will work out a further distribution in regard to other introductions
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